Bid Tabulation Columbia County
Bid No. 2017-CC
Sign Materials

Company Sign Blanks Signs Sign U-Channel | Delineators MOT

Sheeting Posts Equipment
Green

Universal Signs $14,029.42 | $61,270.89 | $50,192.55 | $26,312.50 | $26,625.50 No Bid

Vulcan Signs $15,098.80 | $75,942.12 | $52,395.36 | $34,792.00 | $18,395.00 No Bid

Nippon Carbide Industries No Bid No Bid $55,285.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Safety Products, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,620.00
Osburn Associates, Inc. | $14,630.08 | $65,447.87 | $49,018.50 | $22,847.00 | $25,337.00 | $21,837.00
Safety Zone Specialist, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,284.00 | $19,729.00
Lightle Enterprises of Ohio | $17,519.00 | $86,467.00 | $58,396.62 | $28,898.50 | $21,359.00 | $21,272.00




